

CITY OF COUNCIL BLUFFS FY20-2 PLOW BLADES AND CURB RUNNERS
 BID TABULATION 8/1/19 AT 10:00 A.M.

VENDOR: Michael Todd & Co Inc				
BID BOND: yes				
DELIVERY DAYS: 14 wks ARO				
	PROPOSED ITEM	UNIT PRICE	QTY	EXTENDED PRICE
Rubber 3' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	ESCO Bucyrus 4285622	\$ 356.25	15	\$ 5,343.75
Rubber 4' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	ESCO Bucyrus 4285623	\$ 475.00	50	\$ 23,750.00
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Right Hand	ESCO Bucyrus 4275202	\$ 191.57	20	\$ 3,831.40
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Left Hand	ESCO Bucyrus 4275203	\$ 191.57	10	\$ 1,915.70
Universal Curb Runners	no bid		20	\$ -
Additional mounting hardware, if needed			65	\$ -
TOTAL BID COST:				\$ 34,840.85

VENDOR: Barco Municipal Products Inc				
BID BOND: n/a				
DELIVERY DAYS: n/a				
	PROPOSED ITEM	UNIT PRICE	QTY	EXTENDED PRICE
Rubber 3' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	no bid		15	\$ -
Rubber 4' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	no bid		50	\$ -
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Right Hand	no bid		20	\$ -
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Left Hand	no bid		10	\$ -
Universal Curb Runners	no bid		20	\$ -
Additional mounting hardware, if needed			65	\$ -
TOTAL BID COST:				\$ -

VENDOR: Winter Equipment Company, Inc				
BID BOND: yes				
DELIVERY DAYS: 3 wks ARO				
	PROPOSED ITEM	UNIT PRICE	QTY	EXTENDED PRICE
Rubber 3' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	JM20315 Black Cat Wear Parts	\$ 354.17	15	\$ 5,312.55
Rubber 4' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	JM20415 Black Cat Wear Parts	\$ 472.22	50	\$ 23,611.00
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Right Hand	JOMA CURBRHSTO Black Cat Wear Parts	\$ 107.20	20	\$ 2,144.00
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Left Hand	JOMA CURBLHSTO Black Cat Wear Parts	\$ 107.20	10	\$ 1,072.00
Universal Curb Runners	CURB 6R1434 Black Cat Wear Parts	\$ 74.00	20	\$ 1,480.00
Additional mounting hardware, if needed			65	\$ -
TOTAL BID COST:				\$ 33,619.55

*error in extended price, bidder form noted \$26,611.00

VENDOR: EJS Supply				
BID BOND: yes				
DELIVERY DAYS: 45-60 days				
	PROPOSED ITEM	UNIT PRICE	QTY	EXTENDED PRICE
Rubber 3' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	Kueper Tuca SX 34A56736XB7	\$ 643.00	15	\$ 9,645.00
Rubber 4' Section Front Snow Plow Blade	Kueper Tuca SX 34A56636XB7	\$ 857.00	50	\$ 42,850.00
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Right Hand	Kueper XC Plus 8Z8000011	\$ 195.00	20	\$ 3,900.00
Front Snow Plow Curb Runners Left Hand	Kueper XC Plus 8Z8000010	\$ 195.00	10	\$ 1,950.00
Universal Curb Runners	NSCGU8	\$ 125.00	20	\$ 2,500.00
Additional mounting hardware, if needed			65	\$ -
TOTAL BID COST:				\$ 60,845.00