State of Iowa

IOWA STATE
PLUMBING CODE

2010

Division of Environmental Health
Plumbing and Mechanical Systems Board
Iowa Department of Public Health
Lucas State Office Building
321 E 12" Street
Des Moines, lowa 50319



FOREWORD

Effective July 21, 2010, The UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE (UPC),
2009 Edition, as published by the International Association of
Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO), as amended herein is
the State Plumbing Code for lowa.

This document is the administrative rule (641—Chapter 25(105),
Towa Administrative Code) that adopts the 2009 UPC and amends it.
Provisions of Iowa law governing plumbing are also provided for
reference.

Copies of the UPC may be obtained from:
IAPMO
20001 Walnut Drive South
Walnut, California 91789-2825
(800)854-2766

Copies of this pamphlet (Iowa State Plumbing Code — July 2010)
may be downloaded from our web site at:

www.idph.state.ia.us/eh/plumbing.asp

(click on the green tab labeled Iowa Code)
or, by requesting a copy from the:
Plumbing and Mechanical Systems Board Office

Phone: 1-866-280-1521
E-mail: pmsb@idph.state.ia.us



IOWA STATE PLUMBING CODE

641—25.1(105) Adoption. Section 101 except as noted below
and Chapters 2 to 16 of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition,
as published by the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials, 20001 South Walnut Drive, Walnut, California
91789-2825, are hereby adopted by reference with amendments as
the state plumbing code authorized by lowa Code section 105.4.

Exception to Section 101: Delete “except as provided for in
Section 103.5.5.2” from the end of subsection 101.5.6.

641—25.2(105) Applicability. The provisions of this code are
applicable to the plumbing in buildings or on premises in [owa.

641—25.3(105) Fuel gas piping. Fuel gas piping shall comply
with the requirements of Chapter 12 of the Uniform Plumbing Code,
2009 Edition, unless the provisions conflict with 661—Chapter 226
Liquefied Petroleum Gas, [owa Administrative Code. Where Chapter
12 conflicts with 661—Chapter 226, the provisions of 66 1—Chapter
226 shall be followed.

641—25.4(105) Amendments to the Uniform Plumbing Code.

25.4(1) Section 412. Delete the section and Table 4-1 and insert
the following text and table. Reprinted from the 2009 International
Plumbing Code with permission of the International Code Council.
All rights reserved.

IPC 403.1 Minimum number of fixtures. Plumbing fixtures
shall be provided for the type of occupancy and in the minimum
number shown in Table IPC 403.1. Types of occupancies not shown
in Table IPC 403.1 shall be considered individually by the code
official. The number of occupants shall be determined by the
International Building Code. Occupancy classification shall be
determined in accordance with the International Building Code.



_ = . = | S

quis . $201A125 SNOIS1[a1 1310
201A10S | 000°1 tod 1 | 00z 1od | s¢1d 1 | 051 3ed | pue diysiom Jo saoe[d

juis . o sanIjIoe] uoneuodsuen
21AIDS [| 000°1 23d [ 0g 32d [ 00g 12d T | 00g 33d [ pue sjeutuLIa) o3uassed
7 sSwINISeUWAS eV
i pue sapeole ‘soLreIql|

Jurs ‘ST[ey 21no9] ‘swnasnu
JDIAIDS | 00s +2d 1 - 00z 12d | g9y | gefad | ‘s[ley uomqryxa ‘sarafjed
[ | e ‘Suness jusueuLtad
_ 7 MOYIM SWNLHOIpnY Ajquiessy 1
_ squrs . SHNOD pooJ pue
ELIVNELN pog 33’1 7 00z 1d | sLady | graedy s[1ey 1enbueq ‘sjueIne)say

— o sasodmd xepruuis 10y eV

uow_ﬁw@ 006 12d | —_ ¢ 1ad | | oF xad ot Iod | sgurpping pue s[jey aouep

: 51 | | ‘SWI0AR] ‘sieq ‘sqnioIyIIn

. !!7. | - - i saimjord B

Suis r | d d d uonjow pue sure Furunioprad
aoiares | 008 YL - | 00Tid1 §9 A1 | eTl Rd ] a1 105 sFurpping a4
| | | I2Yl0 pue sIajest],

|
‘¥3aHLo| (Lol | SMAMOHS 3ywwad|3ww 3vwad | 3Tvw NOLLdIN0S3a ADNVANO20 | NOILVDIFISSVID ['ON
NOILD3S __.wm:._.._._._.(.m Pl
33s) _ SIOLVAV | (2°6LF NOLLOTS
;o NIVINNOL | 33S STVYNRIN)
ONIBMNING 7 SLASOTD HIALVM

(£'€0¥ OdI PUE Z°'£0¥ Ddi SUOIIeS 89S)

STHNLXIH DONISINNTd AIHINDIY 40 AIFGWNN NNWININ
L'€0¥ Ddl 3119Vl




| urs
991198 |

Suis

| >qurs

|201A198 |

squrs
2014138 |

20IAIIS HW
|
_
|

001 22d | 0§ 12d | 0s 1ad | SonI[1oR] [RUCHEONPY q [euoneonpy £
. ] ) sasn
08 Sutpasoxa IB[IWIS PUB [BLYShpUI JY3I1]
[ Bﬁ_._.EEu ¥ 0 Bu1paooxd ‘syjueq ‘sFUIpTIng 2010
d [ : ISpuIetay ay} ‘9SIpURYOIAUW SUTAJOAUT
oot 41 Quﬁ 103 08 10§ 05 10d | pue o5 SOO1AISS IO ‘SADIATDS q SEMISRE [4
Iad | pue (g 1Sy 15y oty 10 o7 sad | Teuorssajord
oy} 103 Ot 1od | ‘$$2UISTI] JO UOTIOBSURD
a1 1o} sBurp[ing
a 0TS'1 00S°1
Burpasoxa Surpasxa sauIATOR
| 0 |00z | e prony el RO
s 9Pl 10f OT1
1 10d IO0pPINO IOJ Spuespuers g
slamEl [ d1 |sed | 1od ] pug ‘Gﬁm 1 pae pue sioyowsq ‘sred ¥
0TE 1 181} 0051 1814y JUSWISSNWER ‘SWNIPEIS
ay3 10J ayy 10y
I - 0 oF ad 1| gy aad | (o) ¢ 1u09)
| 0TS 00s1 CIIEEay I
Fuipeaoxs Surpesoxs
Jopurewlal IopuIBLUal SIPTANOE PIRe FIUIAS
. oS 007 a3 105loy) 10§ 071 Sunods 100puUr JOF $1MOD
000°1 1od | wd1 | od 1 09 1ad 1| 1ad | pue| stuus) pue sjood ‘syur v
pue 0z< 1| 00s T 181y Funes ‘seuaie ‘SWNAsIo))
18113 JOJ ay3 10§
oprd i griadq
e — e S TSI S —_ e
Loy SHIMOHS [FTVASL FTVIN ITVINIL | TTVIN NOILdINOS3a AONVANOD0 | NOILVYDIHISSVIO 'ON
NOILLD niHlva
S SHNOLVAVT | (z'6i¥ NOLLD3S
338 SIVNIaN)
;sNIYLNNOd
ONDINING S13S07D J31LVM

(g'€0t DdI PUE Z'£0¥ DdI SUodesg aag)
«SIUNLXIH ONIFGINNTD AFHINODTH 40 ¥IFWNN WNWINIA
penunuos—L g0y Ddi I19V.L



ik 1ad xod 1od 2480
sapayy| OLBEY I gradi s11ed | PIIY> pue oI5 Kep NPy -1
— 001 1ad | e ggrad 1 gz iad |  S9ekorduryg
ik oS19IUa0
AU 001 od | ¢ 1od | craad | ¢ 1ad | [BUOTIOAIIOD PUR “SISIUAD ~
FalAdas T | uonuslep ‘ssLIO}ULIOISY £l
Surs
g { 001 1od | graad | o2 1ad | [1eo xad | JSuostid
- - - = e [euonnIsUf S
i " 1od 2Ied [BluapIsal
006 1=d | 001 22d [ SL I UEL) 1910 “SIONSIA
B 218D [B[IUIPISaI
001 12d | ggaad | gz 1ad | ueys uwﬁo ‘saokordug 2 |
o E— SRV o
sjuened swoy Sursinu
1ad yuis 001 12d | g1 1ad | Jwoor 1ad | Jwooa sad [ anE:LEm ‘spepdsoy
faoratas |
Aus h.m.v.n d P d d 218D [RITUIPISS “
301A188 | 00t [ g12d [ or 2d | 01 Ied | [BHUIPISaY I-1 |
- o S|ElIojBW 10
- ( s1onpoid jo Juissaooid 10
Ribelt) (B84 £ = [eLOsSnpul
00% Iad 1ad 1ad [quIassE "suneoliqej SIom -] pue -
QOIALaS. T ! uo1309g 99s) oot ! oot ! ur pa3e3us a1e syuednoso s pue £10108. L
|
¥3IHLO| (L0lr | SHIMOHS w.._.¢ﬂm._m7_.f_mi IIVNIY| TV | “AONVdNDO0 | NOILVDIJISSY1O ['ON
NOILD3IS |/sgniHivi R T RN T
338) SIMOLVAV1  (Z'6LF NOILDTS
;«sNIVLNNOd 33S STVYNIEN) |
h ONIINING S13S01D HILVM a4

- (g°¢0¥ DdI pue Z'co¥ Odl suoljoeg asg)
STUNLXIH ONISNNTd AIHINOIH 40 HIFNNN WNWININ
panupBuos— L cor Ddl 319Vl




oewoyne | run Sutjjamp sad yuis uaynny | |

syrun Suifjamp (7 12d UOIOAUUD 12YSEM SAYIO[D |

-— mcﬂ__”“sn yun yiun Suramp 12d | asnoy juswpedy ¥
ad " Surjampaad 1 | ;
[BlUapISaY L
|
(Jualsuer] jou) sasnoy
A oo1 12d | grad | o1 xad o1 1ad | Fuipieoq pue sa11IOIOS -4
SopURS T SaNIUWIZNERI] ‘S3LIONULIOC]
Cuis ~ |ywun Suideags|  mun (3uo1suen) sasnoy .
IDIAIE | o ad [ Surdaays 1ad 1 Hut sutdsors Id ' Burpreoq ‘sy:ouw ‘s[2)10H 4
[ i SI9JUS0
juis : d d 3urddoys pue sjayrew
9914195 | 000°T 1od | = 06L 1ed 1 00§ 1ed | ‘suoosa[es ‘sdoys ‘Suonels W SIIuedIS A 9
2D1AIDS ‘S2103S [TBIDY
¥3HLo| Gfoww [ S¥IMOHS [ o ([ | NOILdI¥O$3d | ADNVdNDD0 | NOLLVIIHISSY 1D |ON|
NOLLO3IS |/SENLHLYSE WJ(EN& w:“._ﬁd‘_.z N..*(S_mu_ﬁ ATV _
33s) S3IHOLVAVT | (2’6Ly NOILOAS
;oNIVINNOAd | 33S STIVNIHN)
ONINIEa S13S0T70 ¥3LVM

~ (g’tov DdI Pue Z'€0¥ DdI Suonoag aag)
STUNLXId ONISINNTd AIHIND3Y 40 JIAFINNN WNININIIA
panunuos—L g0y Ddl 319vL



9

"1oM3J 10 ¢ JO peo] Juednsso ue 107 pannbel jou s1e surejunoy Funjuli 4
“apos Suppng (puoupteIM 941 30 [ [ 1odey) pue [°€0y DI 219BL Wim A[dwos [[eys sutejunoy Supuup paiinbal Jo Iequmu WnWIUILE Y[, 2
‘pasinbar $811]198) JO I9QUNU WINWIUIW 9y} SUIUIULISSP UAYM PIpPN[IUT aq [[BYS SESIE JUSIUIELI2IUS PUE Su1jeas JI00PINO [EUOSES 10J PrO] Juednodo sy L, P
‘Koeanrd 1oy suoistaoxd yirm pue nun Furdesys juaned Yoea WO SSIO0E 101D Yl papraoad s1 woos yons
axoym panrwiad aq [Teys syiun Surdosys jusned juadelpe 0m) URY) 210W 10U FUlAIRS ATOIBAR] SUO PUE JOSO[D J3)RM SUO 1M WOOI 19103 juednoso-9j3uls y 2
‘sjuanyed 10 sajewIUL 103 SOI[10€) WOy Meredas aq [Teys s9aAo[dws 10] SANI{I0R] I3[I0.L 4
‘apoy Sutppng (puolpuianf 2Y) AQ paUIULIaLD 29 [[BYS suednoso JO Isquunu ay |, "Pajedrpur

suosiad JO 15qLINU 2y} JO UOIRY AU IO PIEdIpUl SU0SIad JO Isquunu oy 10§ palinbal wnwiuiw i) Suraq SIMX1Y SUO UO PISE] 2UE UMOYS SIIMXY YL,

(¢'cov DdI PuUe Z' €0 Ddl SUCHD3S 29G)
LSTUNLXIA ONIGINNTd dIHINDIY 40 J3aINNN WNININTIN
peanunuo2—L g0 Odl 319V.L

‘prezer]
[ 2jeIapOIA pue moT "syodap "
Huts . 11t uonodag 3 [
. 000°1 1od 1 001 1od | 001 1od | Jjalea] DB SISTLOH A0S aBe101g 8
Po1AIRS H_ 235 ‘sasnoyaem ‘Spoos I-s
,ﬁl _ 10 98eI0)S ) IOJ S2IMIONIS
Suis | ) . Sa1I[108) SUIAL
ﬁo_xi.wm | 001 a5y ga 1 LIRS o1-3d Uﬁmmmmm\uu@%._w.:%uu%wm v
| s T suosiad 19mM3] 10 9 Yim
To_?ﬁm 1| 001 42d | g ad | orsed1 01 35d 1 sanrjoey ural aedaiduo) €4
SR - — -
e
S 2 == (o) (102
528 [BPHUSPISYY L
W W 'ml = w:ﬂEMB Hun pun Suiemp Iod sBulfremp -
W a W.W LM I B Furjamp 1od | _ ; Hismp I | A[urey-om) pue-auQy &
E8&|
=4 P
2:
¥3HIO| e
3 A ZO—._.M%M_m RMMM%_M_._.@M 3TvINT4 3Tvw 3avieadl 3w NOILLdIdOS3a ADNVYdNOD0 | NOWLYD n. S O 'ON
| 33s) SIMOLVAV | (2’61 NOILO3S
| +NIVLNNOd 33S STIVNIHN)
NN S13S07TD HALYM



IPC 403.1.1 Fixture calculations. To determine the occupant load of
each sex, the total occupant load shall be divided in half. To determine the
required number of fixtures, the fixture ratio or ratios for each fixture type
shall be applied to the occupant load of each sex in accordance with Table
IPC 403.1. Fractional numbers resulting from applying the fixture ratios
of Table IPC 403.1 shall be rounded up to the next whole number. For
calculations involving multiple occupancies, such fractional numbers for
each occupancy shall first be summed and then rounded up to the next
whole number.

Exception: The total occupant load shall not be required to be
divided in half where approved statistical data indicates a distribution of
the sexes of other than 50 percent of each sex.

IPC 403.1.2 Family or assisted-use toilet and bath fixtures.
Fixtures located within family or assisted-use toilet and bathing rooms
required by Section 1109.2.1 of the International Building Code are
permitted to be included in the number of required fixtures for either the
male or female occupants in assembly and mercantile occupancies.

403.2 Separate facilities. Where plumbing fixtures are required,
separate facilities shall be provided for each sex.

Exceptions:

1. Separate facilities shall not be required for dwelling units and
sleeping units.

2. Separate facilities shall not be required in structures or tenant
spaces with a total occupant load, including both employees and
customers, of 15 or less.

3. Separate facilities shall not be required in mercantile occupancies
in which the maximum occupant load is 50 or less.

IPC 403.3 Required public toilet facilities. Customers, patrons
and visitors shall be provided with public toilet facilities in structures and
tenant spaces intended for public utilization. The number of plumbing
fixtures located within the required toilet facilities shall be provided in



accordance with Section 403 for all users. Employees shall be provided
with toilet facilities in all occupancies. Employee toilet facilities shall be
either separate or combined employee and public toilet facilities.

IPC 403.3.1 Access. The route to the public toilet facilities
required by Section IPC 403.3 shall not pass through kitchens, storage
rooms or closets. Access to the required facilities shall be from within
the building or from the exterior of the building. All routes shall comply
with the accessibility requirements of the International Building Code.
The public shall have access to the required toilet facilities at all times
that the building is occupied.

IPC 403.3.2 Location of toilet facilities in occupancies other than
covered malls. In occupancies other than covered mall buildings, the
required public and employee toilet facilities shall be located not more
than one story above or below the space required to be provided with toilet
facilities, and the path of travel to such facilities shall not exceed a
distance of 500 feet (152 m).

Exception: The location and maximum travel distances to required
employee facilities in factory and industrial occupancies are permitted to
exceed that required by this section, provided that the location and
maximum travel distance are approved.

IPC 403.3.3 Location of toilet facilities in covered malls. In
covered mall buildings, the required public and employee toilet facilities
shall be located not more than one story above or below the space required
to be provided with toilet facilities, and the path of travel to such facilities
shall not exceed a distance of 300 feet (91 440 mm). In covered mall
buildings, the required facilities shall be based on total square footage, and
facilities shall be installed in each individual store or in a central toilet
area located in accordance with this section. The maximum travel
distance to central toilet facilities in covered mall buildings shall be
measured from the main entrance of any store or tenant space. In covered
mall buildings, where employees’ toilet facilities are not provided in the
individual store, the maximum travel distance shall be measured from the
employees’ work area of the store or tenant space.



IPC 403.3.4 Pay facilities. Where pay facilities are installed, such
facilities shall be in excess of the required minimum facilities. Required
facilities shall be free of charge.

IPC 403.4 Signage. Required public facilities shall be designated by
a legible sign for each sex. Signs shall be readily visible and located near
the entrance to each toilet facility.

IPC 410.1 Approval. Drinking fountains shall conform to ASME
A112.19.1M, ASME A112.19.2M or ASME A112.19.9M and water
coolers shall conform to ARI 1010. Drinking fountains and water coolers
shall conform to NSF 61, Section 9. Where water is served in restaurants,
drinking fountains shall not be required. In other occupancies, where
drinking fountains required, water coolers or bottled water dispensers shall
be permitted to be substituted for not more than50 percent of the required
drinking fountains.

IPC 410.2 Prohibited location. Drinking fountains, water coolers
and bottled water dispensers shall not be installed in public restrooms.

IPC 411.1 Approval. Emergency showers and eyewash stations shall
conform to ISEA Z358.1.

IPC 411.2 Waste connection. Waste connections shall not be
required for emergency showers and eyewash stations.

IPC 419.2 Substitution for water closets. In each bathroom or toilet
room, urinals shall not be substituted for more than 67 percent of the
required water closets in assembly and educational occupancies. Urinals
shall not be substituted for more than 50 percent of the required water
closets in all other occupancies.

25.4(2) Section 503.0. Delete the section.

25.4(3) Section 710.1. Add the following sentences to the end of the
section:
The requirement for the installation of a backwater valve shall apply

only when it is determined necessary by the authority having jurisdiction
based on local conditions. When a valve is required by the authority



having jurisdiction, it shall be a manually operated gate valve or fullway
ball valve. An automatic backwater valve may also be installed, but is not
required.

25.4(4) Section 807.4. Delete the section and insert in lieu thereof
the following:

807.4 No domestic dishwashing machine shall be directly connected
to a drainage system or food waste disposer without the use of an
approved dishwasher air gap fitting on the discharge side of the
dishwashing machine, or by looping the discharge line of the dishwasher
as high as possible near the flood level of the kitchen sink where the waste
disposer is connected. Listed air gap fittings shall be installed with the
flood level (FL) marking at or above the flood level of the sink or drain
board, whichever is higher.

25.4(5) Section 906.7. Change “two (2) inches (50.8 mm)” to “three
(3) inches (76.2 mm)”.

25.4(6) Section 1002.2. Delete Table 10-1 and insert in lieu thereof
the following:

TABLE 10-1
Horizontal Distance of Trap Arms
Trap Arm Size Distance Trap to Vent
Minimum Maximum
Inches Millimeters Inches Millimeters Feet  Meters

1% 32 2-172 64 5 1.5
1% 40 3 76 6 1.8

2 50 4 102 8 24

3 80 6 152 12 3.7

4 100 8 203 12 3.7
>4 >100 2 x Diameter 12 3

Slope one-fourth (1/4) inch per foot (20.9 mm/m)

10



25.4(7) Chapter 16. Delete Part [ and insert in lieu thereof the
following:

Wastewater intended for use in underground irrigation systems shall
be treated in accordance with 567—Chapter 69 Private Sewage Disposal
Systems. The irrigation system shall comply with 567—69.12(455B).

641—25.5(105) Backflow prevention with containment. Cities
with populations of 15,000 or greater as determined by the 1990 census or
any subsequent regular or special census shall have a backflow prevention
program with containment. The minimum requirements for a program are
given in subrules 25.5(1) through 25.5(5). These requirements are in
addition to the applicable requirements of Section 603 of the Uniform
Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition.

25.5(1) Definitions. The following definitions are added to those in
Chapter 2 and Section 603 of the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition,
or are modified from those definitions for the purposes of rule 641—
25.5(105) only.

a. Administrative authority. The administrative authority for this rule is
the city council and its designees.

b. Approved backflow prevention assembly for containment. Approved
backflow prevention assembly for containment means a backflow
prevention assembly which is approved by the University of Southern
California-Foundation for Cross Connection Control and Hydraulic
Research. The approval listing shall include the limitations of use based
on the degree of hazard. The backflow prevention assembly shall also be
listed by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials (IAPMO) or by the American Society of Sanitary Engineering.
(ASSE) as having met the requirements of one of the standards listed
below.

11



Standard Product Covered

ANSI'/ASSE* 1013-2009 Reduced Pressure Principle Backflow Preventers

 ANSI'/ASSE*1015-2009 Double Check Backflow Prevention Assembly

ANSIT/ASSE*1047-2009 Reduced Pressure Detector Backflow Preventer

ANSI'/ASSE*1048-2009 |  Double Check Detector Assembly Backflow Preventer

ANSI/AWWA® C510-07|  Double Check Valve Backflow Prevention Assembly

ANSI'/AWWA" C511-07 | Reduced-Pressure Principle Backflow Prevention Assembly

~ TAmerican National Standards Institute, 1819 L Street NW, Washington,
DC 20036

* American Society of Sanitary Engineering, 901 Canterbury Road, Suite
A, Westlake, OH 44145

* American Water Works Association, 6666 West Quincy Avenue, Denver,
CO 80235

c. Approved backflow prevention assembly for containment in a fire
protection system. Approved backflow prevention assembly for
containment in a fire protection system a backflow prevention assembly to
be used in a fire protection system which meets the requirements of
Factory Mutual Research Corporation (FM) and Underwriters Laboratory
(UL) in addition to the requirements of 25.5(1)“b.”

d. Containment. Containment is a method of backflow prevention
which requires a backflow prevention assembly on certain water services.
Containment requires that the backflow prevention assembly be installed
on the water service as close to the public water supply main as is
practical.

e. Customer. Customer mean the owner, operator or occupant of a
building or property which has a water service from a public water system,
or the owner or operator of a private water system which has a water
service from a public water system.

12



f. Degree of hazard. Degree of hazard means the rating of a cross
connection or a water service which indicates if it has the potential to
cause contamination (high hazard) or pollution (low hazard).

g. Water service. Depending on the context, water service is the
physical connection between a public water system and a customer's
building, property or private water system, or the act of providing potable
water from a public water system to a customer.

25.5(2) Proposed water service.

a. No person shall install, or cause to have installed, a water service
to a building, property or private water system before the administrative
authority has evaluated the proposed water service for degree of hazard.

b. The administrative authority shall require the submission of plans,
specifications and other information deemed necessary for a building,
property or private water system to which a water service is proposed.
The administrative authority shall review the information submitted to
determine if cross connections will exist and the degree of hazard.

c. The owner of a building, property or private water system shall
install, or cause to have installed, an approved backflow prevention
assembly for containment as directed by the administrative authority
before water service is initiated.

d. Reconstruction of an existing water service shall be treated as a
proposed water service for the purposes of rule 641—25.5(135).

25.5(3) Existing water services.

a. The administrative authority shall publish the standards which it
uses to determine the degree of hazard for a water service. These shall be
consistent with standards published by the lowa department of public
health.

b. Each customer shall survey the activities and processes which
receive water from the water service and shall report to the administrative
authority 1f cross connections exist and the degree of hazard.

13



¢. The administrative authority may inspect the plumbing of any
building, property and private water system which has a water service to
determine if cross connections exist and the degree of hazard.

d. If, based on information provided through 25.5(3)“b” and “c,” the
administrative authority determines that a water service may contaminate
the public water supply, the administrative authority shall require that the
customer install the appropriate backflow prevention assembly for
containment.

¢. If a customer refuses to install a backflow prevention assembly for
containment when it is required by the administrative authority, the
administrative authority may order that water service to the customer be
discontinued until an appropriate backflow prevention assembly is
installed.

25.5(4) Backflow prevention assemblies for containment.

a. Backflow prevention assemblies for containment shall be installed
immediately following the water meter or as close to that location as
deemed practical by the administrative authority.

b. A water service determined to present a high hazard shall be
protected by an air gap or an approved reduced pressure principle-
backflow prevention assembly.

¢. A water service determined to present a low hazard shall be
protected by an approved double check valve assembly or as in
25.5(4)*v.”

d. A water service to a fire protection system shall be protected from
backflow in accordance with the recommendations of American Water
Works Association Manual M14. Where backflow prevention is required
for a fire protection system, an approved backflow prevention assembly
for containment in a fire protection system shall be used.

14



25.5(5) Backflow incidents.

a. The customer shall immediately notify the agency providing water
service when the customer becomes aware that backflow has occurred in
the building, property or private water system receiving water service.

b. The administrative authority may order that a water service be
temporarily shut off when a backflow occurs in a customer's building,
property or private water system.

15



IOWA STATUTES
GOVERNING PLUMBING
2009 Code of Iowa

105.4 PLUMBING INSTALLATION CODE -- RULES.

1. The board shall establish by rule a plumbing installation code
governing the installation of plumbing in this state.

135.21 Pay toilets. No person shall make a charge or require any
special device, key or slug for use of a toilet located in a room provided
for use of the public. Violation of this section is a simple misdemeanor.

364.3 Limitations of powers. The following are limitations upon
the powers of a city:

3. A city may not set standards and requirements which are lower or
less stringent than those imposed by state law, but may set standards or
requirements which are higher or more stringent than those imposed by
state law, unless a state law provides otherwise.

16



Plumbing and Mechanical Systems Board
Lucas State Office Building

321 E 12" Street

Des Moines, IA 50319

Phone: 1-866-280-1521
E-mail: pmsb@idph.state.ia.us



	S36C-115090913500
	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7
	8
	9
	10
	11
	12
	13
	14
	15
	16
	17
	18

